
CRA Job Ad 
 
Tandon CSE Faculty Fellowship Position 
 
The Department of Computer Science and Engineering at the Tandon School of 
Engineering (Tandon CSE) at New York University is seeking to fill multiple Faculty Fellow 
positions, starting in Fall 2024. The Faculty Fellowship Program aims to attract and 
support young scholars and educators from diverse backgrounds, and with research 
interests and expertise that span a wide range of computer science areas. Applicants are 
required to hold a PhD in Computer Science or related discipline. 
The program provides Faculty Fellows with mentoring, professional development, and 
academic networking opportunities, to prepare them for faculty positions in computer 
science at top universities.  Faculty Fellows will do research, both independently and 
with a Tandon CSE faculty mentor.  They will teach 1 course per semester.  The initial 
appointment is for one year, beginning in September 2024, and is renewable for a 
second year.  
 
Fellowship benefits include an annual housing allowance and an allowance for research 
expenses. 
 
We will review applications beginning on January 2, 2024, and will continue until the 
position is filled. We encourage you to submit early.  
NYU is an Equal Opportunity Employer.  NYU Tandon is committed to substantially 
increase the proportion of our faculty from historically underrepresented groups in 
STEM and we encourage candidates from such groups to apply.  
 
In compliance with NYC’s Pay Transparency Act, the annual salary range is $100,000 - 
$120,000 for the Faculty Fellowship position.  New York University considers factors 
such as (but not limited to) scope and responsibilities of the position, candidate’s work 
experience, education/training, key skills, internal peer equity, as well as market and 
organizational considerations when extending an offer. 
 
See Interfolio for additional information and to submit your application. 

https://engineering.nyu.edu/academics/departments/computer-science-and-engineering
https://engineering.nyu.edu/academics/departments/computer-science-and-engineering
https://apply.interfolio.com/135584

